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APPENDIX 1c 
 
 

AUTHOR’S PERSONAL BACKGROUND 
 
 

This document is part of, and intended to be read in conjunction with, 
all parts of and appendices to the document entitled CSIROh! 

 
 
 
I have an honours engineering degree from the University of Queensland, Australia. 
My rigorous statutory qualifications led to statutory positions responsible for the 
lives and livelihood of hundreds of people. My Masters degree in Business 
Administration from the Graduate School of Business (now the Booth School) at the 
University of Chicago trained me in statistically sound objective analysis of data. I 
continue to personally explore the human condition and human behaviour 
extensively using western and eastern philosophies and methods. 
 
My educational qualifications are similar to those of the UN IPCC Chairman, Dr. 
Rajendra Pachauri, the so-called “world’s top climate scientist”. He wrote part of the 
‘science’ in UN IPCC reports. 
 
I’m a professional speaker and provide a specialised hands-on management and 
leadership service to leaders in business around the world. 
 
For five years I’ve voluntarily investigated climate science and corruption of climate 
science. Apart from a very small portion of expenses reimbursed by people’s 
donations to the voluntary Galileo Movement* my work has been funded entirely by 
me and by my family. 
* I was appointed as the Project Leader of The Galileo Movement. Voluntary position. 
 
My work on climate has cost my family and me well over a million dollars in foregone 
income and in travel and other expenses. I have no conflicts of personal or financial 
interest and pursue no vested financial interest in revealing climate reality. 
 
I am not affiliated with any political party. I receive no funding or material support 
from any industry, individual or organisation. I am blessed though with much 
encouragement from people who cherish truth and desire a future for our country 
and for our planet. 
 
My personal declaration of interests has been maintained publicly since publishing 
my first document on global warming (now aka climate change) in 2009. It’s 
available at: 
http://www.conscious.com.au/__documents/additional%20material/Personal%20d
eclaration%20of%20interests.pdf 
It presents my qualifications and broad work experience. 

http://www.conscious.com.au/__documents/additional%20material/Personal%20declaration%20of%20interests.pdf
http://www.conscious.com.au/__documents/additional%20material/Personal%20declaration%20of%20interests.pdf
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I’ve read thousands of pages of climate science. They in turn reference many 
thousands more pages. I’ve discussed climate change with prominent scientists and 
politicians on both sides of the global warming issue in Australia and internationally. 
I’ve written to all nine prominent government-funded Australian academics 
advocating action against human carbon dioxide (CO2), agencies employed by 
government and prominent federal politicians from all parties holding them 
accountable. Their responses are intriguing and disturbing. See appendices. 
 
My adult work started as a vineyard worker before three years as a coalface miner, 
mostly underground. I then worked in technical positions before entering 
management and leadership positions. I’ve been Chairman of the Board of a small 
closely held public company. 
 
My travels have been extensive and include all fifty American states, all Australian 
states and all but one Canadian province and territory. I’ve lived in varied climate 
regions. My work has taken me to China, Japan, Korea, Singapore, New Zealand, 
eight American states, Canada, Britain and most Australian states. I’ve travelled to 
Europe. My country of birth and my residence for my childhood years was India 
where my parents were stationed. 
 
 
Professional work 
 
My professional work is across all industry sectors in Australia and overseas. My 
work experience includes Fortune 500 companies internationally. 
 
I provide a specialised management and leadership service and write, speak and 
consult on human freedom. 
 
I provide leaders with knowledge and methods that free and connect people to be 
both more productive and at ease. Personal and organisational clients have included 
company directors and Chief Executives. I’ve served people at all management levels. 
 
What I’ve seen is that people in business, politics and relationships are often plagued 
by sub-conscious fears and guilt that can be released and removed and people freed 
by understanding the Human Condition and the laws of Nature. 
 
Specifically I assist leaders to understand how to improve organisational and 
personal performance. That involves assisting leaders to understand what really 
makes their people tick. Then we build conscious systems with care to free and 
connect their people. Organisations become more productive and people become 
happier, more peaceful and at ease—with themselves, with life, free. 
 
My analysis and methods are based on understanding universal human needs and 
drivers of human consciousness and behaviour. These guide and support clients. 
Using my methods some clients have doubled productivity without capital 
expenditure. 
 
Methods are based on each client organisation’s core processes and on developing 
leadership. Australian and overseas clients include commercial and non-profit 
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organisations and government departments. When needed, I provide personal 
coaching for executives, directors and business owners. 
 
 
Voluntary work on climate, the environment and freedom 
 
My voluntary work during the last five years provides people with knowledge and 
understanding of climate science and corruption to meet people’s needs for 
reassurance and ease. My work includes assisting people to understand what really 
makes people tick*, and then to understand how systems are being manipulated to 
drive corrupt behaviours. By assisting people to understand variation in Nature, they 
develop reassurance and ease—understanding, clarity, security, comfort, peace and 
freedom. 
 
*My voluntary work is based on conveying understanding of laws of Nature and the Human Condition. 


